FINANCIAL CAMPAIGN REPORT

TO: Tooele County, Recorder

Full Name of Candidate Lorri Warr Witkowski

Street Address 26 Bates Canyon Road

City _ Erda o , Utah 84074
Phone: Home (435) 840-0360 Business

Name of Office Erda City Council

District Office (If Applicable) Five (5)

Political Pa vty (f Applicable)

TOTALS FROM TOTALS FROM - CUMULATIVE
LASTREPORT THIS REPORT ) REPORT
1. Total contributions (from Form "A" on page 2) . 0 » 0 0
2. Total campaign expenses (from Form "B" on
page 3) 0 821,88 821.88
4. Balance at the end of this reporting period 0 . 821.88 821.88

I do hereby certify that, to the best of my knowledge, all receipts and expenditures have been reported for the period
beginning ___6/1/2021__and ending __10/21/2021_and that there are no bills or obligations outstanding and unpaid
except as set forth in this report.

Date v 1072 1/2021




Date

ITEMIZED CONTRIBUTION REPORT (FORM "A")

Name of Contributor Mailing Address & Zip Code

Amount

$0

{Ifadditional spaceis needed, use blank paper and list information in the aboveformat and file with this report)




67212021

@WTOOELE
COUNTY

Tooeke County Clerk
Receipt for Services Rendered

Description

Filing Fee

Description
Card ***5318 - Lorri Witkowski

Reeipt No Date

TCC-BINAUJZR Jun 02, 2021

=PRI~

nvaics ftems

Gty Price
1 53500
Total

Payments

Amount  Fee
2500 15D

Total Due
Total Paid
Customer Change

Total
52500
52500

Total
2650

42650
$26,50
50,00

Marilyn K Gillette, Toosle Sounty Clerk | 47 5 Main St Tooele, UT B&074 | 435-843-3211

1M



Roni's Signs & Window Désigns

How was your experience?

310.16

Custom Amount $310.16

Total $310.16

4 0¢s

1420 N

= 1370 N Cex

Roni's Signs & Window Designs
627 E 1370 N
TOOELE, UT 84074-9845




Will you call me for the cc info. or Imk what works best.

Thanks again,

ey
55 o,

From: Elizabeth Steele <elizabeth@ﬂggﬁcagencv.coﬁﬁ /
Date: Wednesday, July 21, 2021 at 2:6.PM o

To: Lorri Witkowski <lorri.witkowski@beehive.net>
Subject: Re: Yard Signs

Hi Lorri,

I wanted to follow up with you and see if you had any questions about the quote |
shared with you?

Thanks!

On Tue, Jul 20, 2021 at 11:44 AM Elizabeth Steele <elizabeth@relicagency.com> wrote:

Hi Lorri,
I have an estimate for you on these signs for a quantity of 25:

Printing = $285.8

Postage = $21
e

s
Total = $307.23

CPP =512.29
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